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ASX / Media Announcement                 Melbourne, 4 July 2008 
 

Exciting Entry into the Uranium Market for Clean TeQ 
 
Clean TeQ Holdings Limited (ASX; CLQ), an Australian technology company in resource recovery and 
air and water purification, today announced that the Company has entered into an agreement to construct 
a Clean-iX® Resin-In-Pulp Pilot Plant at the Langer Heinrich uranium mine in Namibia owned by Paladin 
Energy.   
 
‘This Pilot Plant will demonstrate the Clean-iX® Resin-In-Pulp (cRIP) technology for uranium extraction.  
This technology has been developed to deliver improved returns from a uranium resource and reduce the 
environmental impact of processing plants,’ Clean TeQ’s Chief Executive Officer, Greg Toll, said.   
 
‘This is an exciting development as it is the first agreement entered into by Clean TeQ in the uranium 
mining industry.  It provides the next stage of development of the Clean-iX® technology and enhances 
our credibility in the uranium sector and recognises Clean TeQ’s expertise in this high growth industry.  
The agreement is also further evidence of the ongoing developments that we are achieving in our 
resource recovery division,’ said Mr Toll.   
 
New Appointments 
 
With Clean TeQ continuing to invest in the development of resource recovery technology, the Directors 
are pleased to announce that the Company has strengthened its resource recovery management team 
with Bob Cleary and Werner Haymann now working with the Company’s resource recovery division.   
 
Bob Cleary has extensive senior executive experience in the Uranium industry where he rose to the 
position of CEO of ERA.  Bob is currently Chairman of Crossland Uranium Mines Ltd, and UMC Energy 
plc and a Director of Natasa Mining Ltd.  He also provides consulting services to these companies. 
 
Werner Haymann’s considerable mining operations experience includes past positions as Director and 
General Manager Operations at Rossing Uranium Limited in Namibia, the MORAK Gold Mining Venture 
in Mauritania and as General Manager Operations of the Blair Athol Coal Project in Central Queensland. 
 
‘These appointments along with the continuing investment by Clean TeQ in this industry will enable the 
Company to gain considerable value for its Clean-iX® technology in the future,’ said Mr Toll. 
 
For more information: 
 
Greg Toll, Chief Executive Officer  +613 9706 8244 
Marc Lichtenstein, Company Secretary +613 9706 8244 
 
About Clean TeQ Holdings Limited (ASX: CLQ) 
 
Clean TeQ is an Australian mining and environmental services group focused on developing, 
commercialising and selling air purification, resource recovery and water purification technologies.  The 
Company listed on the Australian Stock Exchange in November 2007.  For more information about Clean 
TeQ please visit the Company’s website at www.cleanteq.com. 
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